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Introduction 

1. The Working Group on the Universal Periodic Review (UPR), established in accordance 
with Human Rights Council resolution 5/1 of 18 June 2007, held its fifth session from 4 to 15 
May 2009.  The review of the Central African Republic was held at the 1st meeting, on 4 May 
2009.  The delegation was headed by Mr. Henri Maidou, Ancien Vice-Président de la 
République, Conseiller Personnel du Chef d’Etat, Responsable des Droits de l’Homme et de la 
Bonne Gouvernance, Président de Suivi des Actes du Dialogue Politique Inclusif. At its 5th 
meeting, on 6 May 2009, the Working Group adopted the present report on the Central African 
Republic. 

2. On 8 September 2008, the Human Rights Council selected the following group of 
rapporteurs (troika) to facilitate the review of the Central African Republic:  Bolivia, Bosnia and 
Herzegovina and Gabon. 

3. In accordance with paragraph 15 of  the annex to resolution 5/1, the following documents 
were issued for the review of the Central African Republic: 

 (a) A national report submitted in accordance with paragraph 15 (a) 
(A/HRC/WG.6/5/CAF/1);  

 (b) A compilation prepared by the Office of the United Nations High Commissioner 
for Human Rights (OHCHR) in accordance with paragraph 15 (b) (A/HRC/WG.6/5/CAF/2); 

 (c) A summary prepared by OHCHR in accordance with paragraph 15 (c) 
(A/HRC/WG.6/5/CAF/3).  

4. A list of questions prepared in advance by Argentina, the Czech Republic, Denmark, 
Germany, Hungary, Latvia, the Netherlands, Sweden and the United Kingdom of Great Britain 
and Northern Ireland was transmitted to the Central African Republic through the troika.  These 
questions are available on the extranet of the UPR. 

I.  SUMMARY OF THE PROCEEDINGS OF THE REVIEW PROCESS 

A.  Presentation by the State under review 

5. A la première séance, le 4 mai 2009, M. Maidou a remercié les membres du Conseil des 
droits de l’homme pour l’attention particulière qu’ils portent à la situation sociopolitique de la 
République centrafricaine en général, et en particulier celle des droits de l’homme. 

6. Le comité de rédaction s’est heurté à un double obstacle lors de la rédaction du rapport: 
d’une part, le pays était en proie à une crise militaro-politique qui a paralysé toutes les activités 
des institutions étatiques ; d’autre part, la crise financière internationale a rendu plus difficile 
encore toute mobilisation de fonds pouvant permettre le financement des travaux du comité. 
Cependant, la détermination et l’attachement du Président de la République aux questions des 
droits de l’homme a permis l’aboutissement de ce rapport.  

7. La délégation a souligné l’effort consenti par le Gouvernement pour améliorer les droits 
de l’homme et qui se traduit par des actions sur le plan social, sécuritaire, institutionnel et 
juridique. 
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8. Sur le plan social et sécuritaire, la délégation a cité le paiement régulier des salaires ; la 
résolution des crises militaro-politiques ayant abouti au Dialogue Politique Inclusif (DPI) qui 
s’est tenu à Bangui en décembre 2008 et dont sont issues des recommandations fortes ; la mise 
en place d’un Comité de Suivi desdites recommandations dans le but de veiller à leur exécution 
intégrale; l’instauration d’un dialogue permanent entre le Gouvernement et les partenaires 
sociaux (syndicats) en vue de régler pacifiquement tous conflits sociaux éventuels à travers une 
commission tripartite ; la restructuration des Forces Armées et le programme de démobilisation, 
désarmement et réinsertion (DDR) des ex-rebelles à l’issue du DPI, qui ont permis la renaissance 
de la confiance entre l’armée nationale et le peuple.  

9. La délégation a indiqué que le déploiement de l’Opération militaire de l’Union 
européenne et de la Mission des Nations Unies en République centrafricaine et au Tchad dans le 
nord-est du pays avait permis le retour des réfugiés et des déplacés et rassuré la population de 
cette zone affectée par les actes d’agression des forces négatives entre 2006 et 2007. 

10. Le Tribunal Militaire Permanent a été réactivé et permet de juger dans les délais tout acte 
de violation des droits de l’homme commis par les forces de défense et de sécurité. Par ailleurs, 
le taux de braquages ou de vols à mains armées a sensiblement été réduit grâce au programme 
DDR conduit par le Gouvernement avec l’appui de la communauté internationale. 

11. Sur le plan institutionnel et juridique, la délégation a indiqué qu’une nouvelle constitution 
avait été adoptée le 27 décembre 2004. Elle consolide la démocratie par la création d’un Conseil 
national de la médiation et d’un Haut Conseil de la communication. 

12. La délégation a informé le Groupe de travail de l’adoption de plusieurs instruments 
juridiques de promotion et de protection des droits de l’homme tant sur le plan national 
qu’international.  

13. La République centrafricaine est un Etat de droit qui a multiplié les efforts pour rendre 
effectives et visibles la promotion et la protection des droits de l’homme sur l’ensemble du 
territoire et s’est engagé sur la voie de la démocratie avec un peuple uni, décidé à reconstruire le 
pays et à consolider la paix et la cohésion nationale. 

14. Cependant, la délégation a souligné que, compte tenu de la limite de ses moyens et 
capacités, la seule détermination de son Gouvernement ne saurait suffire à la réalisation de ces 
engagements. Elle a ainsi invité la communauté internationale à contribuer à la réalisation de ses 
engagements.  

15. Enfin, le Gouvernement s’attèle actuellement à la préparation des échéances électorales 
de 2010 dans l’esprit de la recommandation du DPI y relative. La délégation a sollicité l’appui de 
la communauté internationale pour la réussite de ce processus. 

B.  Interactive dialogue and responses by the State under review 

16. During the interactive dialogue, 43 delegations made statements. A number praised the 
Central African Republic for its detailed and comprehensive national report, including a self-
critical assessment, and for its commitment to the UPR process. Several delegations welcomed 
the voluntary commitments it had made. A number of delegations noted with great appreciation 
the poverty reduction strategy paper and the 2007-2011 National Action Plan to combat gender-
based violence. The conduct of an inclusive political dialogue was also commended. 
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17. Algeria noted the State’s commitment to consolidating peace and stability. Algeria 
recommended that the State (a) avail itself of technical assistance offered by OHCHR to submit 
its overdue reports, also sharing in this respect the recommendation of the Committee on the 
Elimination of Racial Discrimination (A/HRC/WG.6/5/CAF/2, para. 68); (b) consider 
implementing, with the assistance of OHCHR, a training and awareness-raising programme on 
international human rights and humanitarian law for members of the security forces, law 
enforcement officials and judicial officials; and (c) as stated by the Committee on the Rights of 
the Child, solicit and receive technical and financial assistance from the international 
community, particularly from United Nations bodies and programmes, to give tangible form to 
various sections of the poverty reduction strategy paper, especially restoration of security, 
consolidation of peace and prevention of conflict, promotion of good governance, reconstruction 
of the economy and diversification and development of human capital. 
 
18. Brazil welcomed the Government’s commitment to addressing gender-based and sexual 
violence; health policies; and educational measures for the integration of refugee children from 
neighbouring countries. Brazil sought elaboration on the National Action Plan, especially 
regarding genital mutilation and efforts to prevent discrimination against women in education. 
Brazil (a) proposed considering acceding to the Convention against Torture and Other Cruel, 
Inhuman or degrading Treatment or Punishment (CAT); (b) noted that efforts to abolish the 
death penalty and to ratify the Second Optional Protocol to the International Covenant on Civil 
and Political Rights (ICCPR-OP 2) would be most welcomed; and (c) encouraged the 
Government to accomplish progressively the human rights goals set forth in  Council resolution 
9/12, in particular increased cooperation with all United Nations human rights mechanisms, 
including special procedures and treaty bodies. It called for international assistance in 
strengthening national institutions. It asked about measures to facilitate the return of internally 
displaced persons (IDPs) to their localities. 
 
19. The Netherlands noted the challenges faced by the State, requiring the international 
community’s support. It enquired about measures to uphold the rights of IDPs and refugees and 
improve prison conditions. Citing United Nations reports, it recommended (a) strengthening 
efforts to guarantee minimum conditions within police custody and detention centres in 
accordance with international standards, and following up the specific recommendations of 
United Nations bodies in this regard; (b) taking as soon as possible the necessary measures to 
safeguard the rights of IDPs and refugees, ensure protection of the civilian population in 
accordance with international standards and follow up on the specific recommendations in this 
regard of the Human Rights Committee and the Representative of the Secretary-General on the 
human rights of internally displaced persons; and (c) taking further measures to combat maternal 
mortality and give specific follow-up to the recommendation of the Committee on the Rights of 
the Child’s concerning the availability of free medical assistance to pregnant women. 
 
20. Nigeria noted progressive reforms regarding the Criminal Procedure and Labour Codes, 
non-governmental organizations, women and girls, persons with disabilities and establishment of 
the national human rights commission. Nigeria recommended (a) continuing to strengthen its 
Court of Justice with a view to its carrying out its constitutional role without fear or favour; and 
(b) continuing its extensive reforms with a view to addressing institutional shortcomings and 
weaknesses, and developing an integrated agenda of human rights and public security as well as 
development agenda towards poverty and illiteracy eradication. It asked that international help 
be extended to strengthen national human rights institutions. 
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21. Djibouti welcomed, inter alia, initiatives leading to a national reconciliation plan; 
measures to combat interference in freedom of expression; efforts to promote the rights of 
vulnerable groups and the establishment of quotas in the civil service for persons with 
disabilities. It encouraged the Government to continue combating all forms of discrimination. 
Djibouti recommended considering ratifying the Optional Protocol to the Convention on the 
Rights of the Child on the involvement of children in armed conflict (CRC-OP-AC) and the 
Convention on the Political Rights of Women, and that the international community provide 
technical and financial support to allow the State to achieve the Millennium Development Goals 
(MDGs) and overcome economic difficulties exacerbated by the current financial crisis. 
 
22. Italy commended the State for its de facto moratorium on executions. It recommended (a) 
seizing the opportunity raised by the ongoing review of the Penal Code to consider abolishing 
capital punishment and acceding to ICCPR-OP 2. Noting concerns expressed by the Human 
Rights Committee and the Committee on the Rights of the Child, Italy recommended (b) 
modifying legislative provisions that may discriminate against women and in particular speeding 
up the process of bringing the Family Code in line with international instruments; (c) enhancing 
awareness-raising campaigns to combat and eradicate female genital mutilation and other 
traditional practices harmful to young women; and (d) guaranteeing the right to education of all 
children and taking effective measures to substantially increase the rate of attendance in primary 
schools. Enrolment in primary education and the negative trend of attendance in primary schools 
caused concern. 
 
23. Sweden appreciated the Government’s commitment to human rights. It expressed 
concern about serious violations in the north between 2005 and mid-2007, when hundreds of 
civilians reportedly were summarily executed and thousands of homes destroyed. Sweden 
recommended that the Government increase efforts to investigate and prosecute the individuals 
known to be responsible for those violations; ensure that victims are guaranteed remedy, 
including the right to compensation and reparation; and continue efforts to improve the 
protection of the civilian population. Welcoming the law on reproductive health and efforts to 
mobilize public opinion against female genital mutilation, Sweden recommended prohibiting 
female genital mutilation and taking further steps to prevent and address the occurrence of the 
practice. 
 
24. Portugal welcomed the ratification of most core international human rights treaties and 
recommended that the State consider signing the Optional Protocol to the International Covenant 
on Economic, Social and Cultural Rights (OP-ICESCR) at the opening ceremony for signature in 
New York in 2009. Appreciating that capital punishment had not been applied since 1981, it 
strongly recommended its abolition. It recommended ratification of ICCPR-OP 2 and that the 
revision of the Criminal Procedure and Criminal Codes be used to tackle the question of the 
death penalty. Concerned about persistent discrimination against women and regretting that 
polygamy had not been abolished, it highly recommended that the Family Code be brought into 
line with international instruments. It urged the Government to respond to the Human Rights 
Committee’s request to submit information within one year on the follow-up to its 
recommendations in 2005 on female genital mutilation. It encouraged all rebel groups to release 
children serving in their ranks and to end further recruitment in accordance with international 
obligations.  
 
25. France congratulated the State for signing the Declaration on sexual orientation and 
gender identity. France noted instances of extrajudicial execution of criminals and delinquents, 



           A/HRC/12/2
           Page 7 
 

 

gangland killings and a racketeering practice by members of the defence and security forces, and 
asked about measures to end impunity in that regard. France recommended that even if the death 
penalty had not been applied for many years, any reference to it should be removed from the 
penal code, as should the crime of witchcraft. Citing numerous reports of torture and ill-
treatment in prisons and police stations, France said that those practices must end and the State 
should sign and ratify CAT and its Optional Protocol (OP-CAT). France recommended rapid 
accession to the International Convention for the Protection of All Persons from Enforced 
Disappearance (CED) and rapid review of the Family Code to abrogate all discriminatory 
provisions against women. 
 
26. Burkina Faso welcomed the Government’s determination to respect international human 
rights commitments. It welcomed normative and institutional initiatives to guarantee women’s 
rights. It recommended that the State continue efforts to ensure human rights, despite the variety 
of real constraints facing it, and that this effort be supported by OHCHR as well as the whole 
international community.  
 
27. The United States of America asked about measures to prevent the recruitment and use of 
child soldiers in Government-sanctioned self-defence militias. It recommended that the 
Government (a) demonstrate its firm commitment to preventing the unlawful recruitment of 
child soldiers by directing the Ministry of the Interior to systematically monitor self-defence 
militias; and (b) prevent extrajudicial killings by members of the military, including the 
presidential guard, and bring to justice those members of the military responsible for 
extrajudicial killings. 
 
28. Mexico asked the donor community to work with the State to identify key programmes to 
achieve stability and development. Mexico enquired about reforming the governance and 
electoral process and re-establishing the authority of the State and security in the provinces, 
especially in the north. Mexico recommended (a) extending an open and ongoing invitation to all 
human rights mechanisms to visit the country; (b) continuing national efforts in the area of 
disarmament, demobilization and reintegration and the reform of institutions involved in security 
and promotion of the rule of law; (c) ratifiying CAT,  the Convention on the Elimination of All 
Forms of Discrimination against Women (CEDAW) and CRC-OP-AC; and (d) taking all 
necessary measures to combat the recruitment and use of children in hostilities, including by 
releasing children associated with the conflict. 
 
29. The Congo applauded progress, especially the return to peace. It encouraged the State in 
its efforts to create a society more respectful of human rights. It noted remarkable efforts, despite 
difficulties, to promote the rights of women, children, minorities, persons with disabilities and 
senior citizens. It cited the establishment of a follow-up committee and the implementation of 
CEDAW.  It recommended continuing efforts to put a halt to banditry and help alleviate the 
suffering of its people by reforming its security services, and that the international community 
provide the necessary technical and financial assistance so that efforts undertaken for good 
governance are not compromised. 
 
30. Slovenia, welcoming the priority given to children, was concerned by the reported lack of 
protection from violence, especially regarding sexual violence, genital mutilation, recruitment by 
armed forces and groups and accusations of witchcraft. Slovenia recommended taking 
appropriate action to adopt and amend domestic legislation, including the Penal Code, and 
effectively implementing that legislation to protect children from all forms of violence. Slovenia 
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enquired about action to prevent violence and discrimination against women and girls and to 
criminalize genital mutilation. It recommended taking all appropriate action to end the impunity 
of perpetrators of human rights crimes and cooperate with the International Criminal Court in 
that regard. 
 
31. Azerbaijan recommended accession to ICCPR-OP 2 and CAT. Citing the fighting 
between armed forces and rebels and the activities of illegal groups like “zaraguinas”, it 
recommended continuing to fight firmly against arbitrary executions and impunity, assuring the 
protection of the civilian population and promoting the return of refugees and displaced persons 
to their regions of origin. It called for active cooperation with United Nations special procedures. 
It recommended continuing to put in place effective strategies to reduce poverty, particularly in 
rural areas. Noting the low level of education of children and the illiteracy rates, it recommended 
implementing measures necessary to change the landscape in this area and promoting the 
reintegration of child soldiers in society. It encouraged continuation of efforts to combat violence 
against women and to eradicate negative traditions.  
 
32. Turkey considered the new policy promoting gender equality as a significant initiative, 
adding that the State was eligible for assistance from the Peacebuilding Fund. Turkey 
recommended that the State consider ratifying CAT, OP-CEDAW and the Optional Protocols to 
the Convention on the Rights of the Child (CRC), make every effort to submit reports to treaty 
bodies in a timely fashion and increase its level of response to questionnaires sent by special 
procedures. Turkey encouraged cooperating with OHCHR in this respect. It asked about 
improving prison conditions. 
 
33. Chad noted with satisfaction the State’s adherence to a number of international human 
rights instruments and its determination to work for human rights promotion and protection. It 
recommended the State continuing its efforts to incorporate provisions of international 
instruments in domestic legislation and becoming a party to international instruments to which it 
is not yet a party. It recommended that the international community support the State in 
improving its human rights situation through technical assistance as appropriate.  
 
34. China appreciated poverty-reduction measures, economic reform, re-establishment of 
security, protection of vulnerable groups and the priority given to education. China suggested 
that the State continue efforts to promote prosperity and stability and the enjoyment of social, 
economic and cultural rights, and adopt systematic measures to ensure the compliance of 
national laws with international human rights treaties. China called for technical and financial 
assistance from the international community to help the country achieve the MDGs. 
 
35. Viet Nam appreciated efforts to establish a human rights protection framework, efforts 
towards dialogue and national reconciliation and the ratification of many human rights 
instruments and measures intended to better protect vulnerable groups. It recommended (a) 
according the greatest priority to measures aimed at better ensuring economic and social rights, 
particularly by devoting more resources to programmes to combat poverty and illiteracy, rates of 
which remain high in the country; and (b) intensifying measures to promote the rule of law while 
consolidating peace and stability through dialogue and national reconciliation mechanisms. 
 
36. Norway, noting visits by several special procedures, recommended that a standing 
invitation be issued to all special procedures. It asked about measures to ensure that security 
forces fulfil their national and international law obligations, and follow-up on urgent appeals of 
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the Special Representative of the Secretary-General on the situation of human rights defenders. 
Norway recommended that all reported human rights violations be investigated and that those 
responsible for such violations, including police officials and personnel within the security 
forces, be prosecuted and punished; that State authorities give human rights defenders legitimacy 
and recognition through supportive statements, and that defenders be protected in accordance 
with the Declaration on the Right and Responsibility of Individuals, Groups and Organs of 
Society to Promote and Protect Universally Recognized Human Rights and Fundamental 
Freedoms. It welcomed reforms promoting press freedom, recommending that necessary steps be 
taken to ensure that journalists are able to operate without intimidation or interference.  
 
37. Austria cited reports of the recent killings of civilians in Sokumba by members of the 
Presidential Guard, also responsible for human rights violations between 2005 and 2007. 
Commending its replacement with other forces in the north, it noted that some members 
presumed responsible had not been brought to justice yet. It recommended (a) immediate 
investigation of all cases of grave human rights violations and ending impunity of perpetrators; 
and (b) implementing the Guiding Principles on Internal Displacement, enacting a national law 
on internal displacement with provisions for protecting displaced children, effectively addressing 
the basic needs of persons affected by internal displacement, and taking every measure to ensure 
the protection of civilians. Deeply concerned about the forced recruitment of children and citing 
reports of frequent and systematic child abductions, Austria recommended (c) taking concrete 
measures to abolish self-defence militias, maintain order through regular security forces and 
facilitate the end of forced child recruitment by all armed groups; and (d) ratifying CRC-OP-AC. 
 
38. Canada appreciated the cooperation of the State with the Peacebuilding Commission. It 
recommended that, in the context of reforming the security sector, the Government review 
training materials used by security forces in order to include child protection as a preventive 
measure against recruiting children into the armed forces. Acknowledging efforts to fight 
impunity, it recommended the adoption within domestic legislation of a law based on the Statute 
of the International Criminal Court, criminalizing war crimes, the crime of genocide and crimes 
against humanity in the Criminal and Military Justice Codes. Alarmed at the situation of refugees 
and displaced persons, it recommended taking measures as necessary to ensure free circulation 
of humanitarian workers so that they may access these vulnerable populations. Canada 
recommended taking necessary measures to implement CEDAW, with emphasis on issues of 
violence and abuse based on gender.  
 
39. Egypt commended efforts to promote human rights despite constraints. It hailed the 
progress and stability since the restoration of the country’s institutions with the 2004 
Constitution. Egypt sought elaboration on the challenges facing furtherance of human rights. It 
recommended continuing efforts to promote all universally agreed human rights and fundamental 
freedoms; continuing resisting attempts to enforce any values or standards beyond the 
universally agreed ones; and continuing exercising its sovereign right of implementing its penal 
code in conformity with universally agreed human rights standards, including the application of 
the death penalty. 
 
40. The United Kingdom recommended taking tangible and concrete steps to conduct free 
and fair presidential elections without undue delay. Recognizing efforts to curb abuses, it 
recommended implementing a thorough training and awareness programme in international 
humanitarian and human rights law for members of the security forces. Hoping that steps would 
be taken to end the culture of impunity, including by publicly and unequivocally condemning 
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abuses at the highest level, it recommended implementing legal sanctions against those who 
commit human rights abuses in the security forces, in addition to administrative sanctions such 
as dismissal; signing CAT and its Optional Protocol in order to provide a further disincentive 
against torture by the security forces and police; and amending the Penal Code to decriminalize 
witchcraft. 
 
41. La délégation centrafricaine a indiqué avoir pris bonne note de toutes les questions qui lui 
ont été posées et a assuré d’en rendre compte au Gouvernement, afin qu’il puisse trouver des 
solutions adéquates aux problèmes de violations des droits de l’homme. 
 
42. En ce qui concerne la question des femmes et des enfants, la délégation a indiqué que le 
Gouvernement prenait toutes mesures pour assurer les droits des femmes et limiter l’enrôlement 
d’enfants dans les forces armées. Elle a indiqué qu’un tel enrôlement n’existait pas dans les 
forces armées régulières, et était le fait de forces rebelles. 
 
43. La délégation a indiqué que le processus de ratification de la Convention contre la torture 
était en cours et que l’instrument de ratification devait être déposé. Concernant la ratification du 
protocole facultatif à ladite convention, la délégation a affirmé que celle-ci interviendrait après la 
ratification de la convention proprement dite. 
 
44. Au sujet des procédures spéciales, la délégation s’est déclarée disposée à les recevoir, 
comme son Gouvernement l’a fait dans les dernières années, à l’égard du Représentant du 
Secrétaire général pour les droits de l’homme des personnes déplacées dans leur propre pays et le 
Rapporteur spécial  sur les exécutions extrajudiciaires, sommaires ou arbitraires. Elle a indiqué 
qu’elle coopère également avec des organisations non gouvernementales, notamment Human 
Rights Watch et Amnesty International. 
 
45. Au sujet de l’impunité notamment des membres des forces de sécurité et de la garde 
présidentielle, la délégation a indiqué que le Tribunal Pénal Militaire est de nouveau actif depuis 
2003. Il a tenu une session où au moins 30 dossiers ont été examinés ; et les crimes, violences et 
voies de faits, des menaces à main armée sont traduits en justice et condamnés. La délégation a 
signalé que le pays faisait face à un problème d’exécution des décisions de justice militaire, 
notamment, parce qu’il existe une connivence entre les gardiens de prisons qui sont militaires et 
les détenus, lors des évasions. A ce sujet, la délégation a indiqué qu’une réforme était en cours 
pour créer un corps de gardiens de prisons non militaires. La délégation a aussi fait état de la 
carence de magistrats ainsi que d’avocats, qui empêche de rendre une justice adéquate. Elle a 
informé le Groupe de travail de certaines réformes, dont celle du système de justice et du 
système carcéral impliquant plusieurs ministères. Des réflexions sont menées et des 
chronogrammes mis en place avec des délais d’exécution. La délégation a cité en exemple la 
visite des prisons, la mise en place d’un observatoire. La délégation a enfin signalé que des 
décisions judiciaires étaient rendues contre les auteurs d’exactions et de violations et que les 
efforts entrepris depuis 2003 ont rendu possible un recul dans la commission de certaines 
infractions. 
 
46. S’agissant du crime de sorcellerie, la délégation a indiqué qu’il s’agissait d’un problème 
culturel et qu’il était impossible de le décriminaliser, ce qui laisserait place à la justice privée. 
Néanmoins, il est possible d’agir sur le quantum des peines prévues par le code pénal. 
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47. Au sujet de la peine de mort, la délégation a indiqué qu’elle pourrait être supprimée dans 
le cadre de la réforme du code pénal en octobre/novembre 2009, d’autant plus qu’elle n’est plus 
appliquée.  
 
48. Au sujet des exécutions extrajudiciaires et du racket, la délégation a indiqué que plusieurs 
décisions ont été rendues à propos des barrières illégales, qui ont été remises en place par 
certains militaires avec des condamnations à la prison ferme. Egalement il y a eu traduction en 
justice de militaires rendus coupables d’exécutions extrajudiciaires.  
 
49. Morocco sought elaboration on the National Plan of Action 2007-2011, the Action Plan 
for Education 2003-2015 and the Poverty Reduction Strategy Paper. It sought elaboration on the 
establishment of a national committee to follow up on implementation of CRC. Morocco 
recommended that the international community give all necessary assistance to the State to 
strenghten its capacity, therefore supporting it in its actions, particularly to attain the MDGs.  
 
50. The Democratic Republic of the Congo referred to the strong national legal framework 
and efforts to effectively combat poverty. It enquired about policies to address high illiteracy 
rates; results of the Poverty Reduction Strategy Paper; and achievements of the National 
Mediation Council. It encouraged the Government to continue its policy of national 
reconciliation and to implement the decisions of the inclusive political dialogue; give tangible 
form to their wish to refurbish the national human rights commission; and envisage ratifying the 
Convention on the Prevention and Punishment of the Crime of Genocide.  
 
51. South Africa welcomed measures to restore the rule of law, particularly adoption of the 
constitution, review of the judicial system, establishment of a juvenile court, retraining of police 
and prison warders to support legal reforms and measures to fulfil human rights obligations in 
the socio-economic sphere and to tackle gender inequalities. It enquired about plans to submit 
outstanding treaty reports and measures to enable resettlement of IDPs; and asked for comments 
on alleged torture and enforced disappearances. It encouraged the Government to continue 
collaborating with OHCHR and United Nations bodies and called upon the international 
community to provide capacity-building programmes and technical assistance. 
 
52. Cote d’Ivoire applauded the substantial progress made despite challenges, including the 
programme to manage schools by local communities, efforts to welcome refugee children from 
neighbouring countries and the creation of tribunals for children in 2001. It recommended the 
Government seek from the international community, and especially from United Nations 
programmes and agencies, support with a view to strengthening, if not already available, 
capacity-building programmes and technical assistance, especially in human rights education, 
child labour, security, assistance to families and communities to help them fight the effects of 
poverty and HIV/AIDS, education and juvenile justice. It exhorted the State to deepen 
institutional reform to promote human rights, increase assistance to IDPs and prevent new 
displacements.  
 
53. Spain recalled the primary responsibility of the State to guarantee security. It 
recommended (a) establishment of a national commission for human rights, with sufficient 
guarantees of independence and adequate material and human resources, which would work in 
close cooperation with the United Nations. Noting discrimination against women in the 
enjoyment of political rights and in education, Spain recommended (b) abolishing polygamy and 
adopting a plan to fight the scourge of  female genital mutilation, criminalizing this practice and 
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mobilizing public opinion against it, and adopting measures to reduce violence against women, 
both rape and domestic violence; (c) the definitive abolition of the death penalty; (d) speeding up 
measures to ensure reintegration into the community of minors giving up their weapons, making 
it possible to comply with the agreements undertaken by the Government and the Union of 
Democratic Forces for Unity with the United Nations; and (e) that these agreements be 
concluded and implemented in the case of other remaining irregular forces. 
 
54. Germany enquired about actions to curb violence against women, especially female 
genital mutilation. It noted a prevalence of diseases like HIV/AIDS, malaria and tuberculosis, 
and asked about action taken. Stressing that IDPs often do not have access to adequate housing, 
infrastructure, education and the health system, Germany asked about strategies to improve their 
situation. Germany recommended that the State abolish the death penalty.  
 
55. The Republic of Korea noted efforts to improve human rights despite challenges, the 
decriminalization of press offences in 2005 and introduction of juvenile courts in 2001. It 
remarked that the judicial system is undermined by arbitrary arrests, detention and delays in the 
administration of justice, and impunity for serious human rights violations. Although there was a 
significant decrease in extrajudicial executions by the armed forces in the north, concerns 
remained about the large number of enforced disappearances, summary executions and torture. It 
recommended (a) focusing attention more on the serious issues of combating impunity; that 
human rights violations should be systematically investigated and those responsible for such 
violations, without exception, should be prosecuted and punished; and (b) further strengthening 
cooperation with the international community, including OHCHR and treaty bodies. 
 
56. Ghana, noting challenges, supported the Government’s call to the international 
community to help strengthen its institutions. Ghana recommended that the Government speed 
up efforts to ensure the proper functioning of the National Human Rights Commission in 
accordance with the Paris Principles; and implement the recommendations made by the Human 
Rights Committee following its consideration of the country’s periodic report.  
 
57. Argentina encouraged the Central African Republic to continue the national dialogue and 
recommended taking all possible measures to ensure respect for and promotion of international 
human rights law, international humanitarian law and international law for refugees. It asked 
about results in preventing the recruitment of children. Noting with interest the creation of a 
National Human Rights Commission, it recommended adapting internal legislation to 
international standards in this area, including the Paris Principles. Argentina invited the State to 
consider ratifying CED and accepting the competence of the Committee on Enforced 
Disappearances. It recommended that it consider ratifying the Protocol to the African Charter on 
Human and Peoples’ Rights on the establishment of an African Court on Human and Peoples’ 
Rights, ICCPR-OP 2, the Convention Governing the Specific Aspects of Refugee Problems in 
Africa, the Convention on the Political Rights of Women, the Convention Relating to the Status 
of Stateless Persons, the Convention on the Nationality of Married Women, international 
conventions on apartheid and the OP-CAT. 
 
58. Belgium noted that cooperation with the United Nations, particularly the Peacebuilding 
Commission and the Working Group of the Security Council on children and armed conflict, was 
encouraging. It asked about Government follow-up to recommendations of the Special 
Rapporteur on extrajudicial, summary or arbitrary executions in 2008. Belgium recommended 
(a) the establishment of a permanent coordination structure for different security forces to 
consistently address various issues such as the training of the military and providing them with 
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weapons; and that members of the security forces receive training in humanitarian and human 
rights law and that they follow a programme for gender awareness at all ranks; and (b) that 
members of the security forces suspected of violations of human rights or humanitarian law be 
rapidly handed over to justice for investigation and judgment. It encouraged severe vetting action 
linked to recruiting and promotion. It recommended (c) signing and ratifying CRC-OP-AC and 
implementing it nationally. 
 
59. The Czech Republic recommended (a) ensuring comprehensive training and education 
for all security forces and prison staff in human rights and international humanitarian law, and 
adopting legal and other necessary measures to ensure their full accountability for any violations 
of these norms; (b) deletion of the crime of witchcraft from the penal code and the launching of 
wide education campaigns against the phenomenon of violence against perceived witches 
together with concrete measures to protect victims or potential victims of such attacks. 
Welcoming decriminalization of press offences, it recommended (c) adoption of further 
measures to ensure in practice protection of journalists against threats and attacks, including 
imprisonment in contravention of their right to freedom of expression. On upholding the 
principle of non-discrimination, particularly relating to women and minorities, including sexual 
minorities, it recommended (d) reviewing all relevant national legislation so that it complies 
fully with international instruments that prohibit all forms of discrimination. 
 
60. Angola cited treaty body concerns about the lack of an appropriate legal framework, 
owing to a need to update the judicial system and customary practices that endanger children’s 
rights, and about discrimination against girls. Angola enquired about steps to fulfil obligations 
under CRC, and how the international community could contribute. Angola recommended 
continuing applying strategies to reduce criminality, address sexual abuse and child trafficking 
and protect civilians from criminals. 
 
61. Gabon noted major political troubles encountered and welcomed efforts to promote 
human rights in conformity with international commitments. Given the evolution of the State to 
one where citizens can enjoy fundamental rights, despite an international financial crisis, Gabon 
recommended to the international community, particularly OHCHR, to provide technical support 
in various areas to the country; and signing OP-ICESCR. 
 
62. Japan applauded progress towards democratization and political stability; efforts to 
promote human rights and eliminate gender-based discrimination; and awareness-raising of 
human rights. Japan recommended that the State (a) continue to address reinstating of the rule of 
law through a fair and transparent electoral process and governance reform, reducing poverty 
which has caused worsening security, establishing basic infrastructure and creating jobs, with the 
support of the United Nations and the international community; (b) further work to improve 
women’s political participation, educational opportunities and status in marriage relationships as 
well as to reduce the maternal mortality rate, one of the highest in the world; and (c) ratify in 
timely fashion the Optional Protocols to CRC. 
 
63. Latvia welcomed the State’s ratification of many human rights instruments, including the 
Rome Statute of the International Criminal Court. It recommended that the Government consider 
extending a standing invitation to all special procedures of the Human Rights Council. 
 
64. Senegal noted with interest measures to improve the status of women, children and 
persons with disabilities. It welcomed the 10 per cent quota in the civil service for disabled 
persons and the bill on the protection of older persons. It cited concerns on poverty, illiteracy, 
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education and certain human rights. It encouraged the authorities to stand firm in pursuing 
reforms to bridge gaps and meet security challenges, and to identify clearly the need for 
technical assistance. 
 
65. Tunisia welcomed efforts to promote human rights, despite difficulties, particularly to 
combat poverty. It encouraged the State to continue implementing its poverty reduction strategy 
paper as a framework for dialogue and reference for all questions regarding national 
development policies. It noted with interest efforts to promote the rights of disabled persons and 
stated that adequate assistance by the international community is necessary to enable the State to 
meet the MDGs. 
 
66. Cameroon, noting the post-conflict situation, encouraged the Government in eradicating 
road blocks, armed attacks and the proliferation of small weapons and advancing the rule of law, 
good governance and national reconciliation. Cameroon urged the international community to 
support the people of the country for a better future. 
 
67. Bangladesh appreciated efforts to ensure greater access to education, health care, safe 
drinking water and sanitation. Noting treaty body concerns, it urged the international community 
to support efforts to implement the poverty reduction strategy paper and other national 
development programmes. It recommended that (a) with the support of the international 
community, the State further strengthen the national security forces and law enforcement 
agencies through various capacity-building measures; and (b) with the assistance of the 
international community, it undertake a multipronged approach to improve the situation of 
children with greater focus on ensuring universal primary education, reducing infant and child 
mortality and rehabilitation of child combatants.  
 
68. Concernant la sécurité, la délégation centrafricaine a indiqué qu’un comité avait été créé 
et qu’un processus de désarmement des rebelles est en cours, susceptible de ramener plus de 
sécurité. Par ailleurs, des casernes ont été créées pour assurer la sécurité des populations civiles. 
 
69. Concernant la scolarisation des jeunes filles, la délégation a souligné qu’il s’agit d’un 
problème culturel, car les jeunes filles ne sont pas automatiquement scolarisées. Cependant, leur 
taux de scolarisation s’élève à 60 % et va progresser avec la création des structures. 
 
70. La délégation a souligné que des campagnes de sensibilisation étaient engagées 
notamment par le Bureau d'appui des Nations Unies pour la consolidation de la paix en 
République centrafricaine qui a organisé des stages à l’égard des militaires et paramilitaires sur 
la question du respect des droits de l’homme. 
 
71. La délégation a signalé avoir entrepris des efforts en ce qui concerne le VIH/SIDA, 
notamment à l’endroit des malades et que des campagnes étaient actuellement par l’OMS.  
 
72. Au sujet des violations à l’égard des femmes et des enfants, la délégation a encore signalé 
l’aide apportée par les organismes internationaux dans la vulgarisation de la loi 06-032, en 
direction des jeunes filles ; et les femmes dont les droits sont violés ont pris connaissance de 
cette loi. Une vulgarisation a également eu lieu au niveau des préfectures. Des formations pour 
les para-juristes ont été menées pour les aider dans leur travail de terrain. Concernant la CRC, un 
plaidoyer pour la ratification du CRC-OP-AC a eu lieu auprès du Gouvernement. 
 



           A/HRC/12/2
           Page 15 
 

 

73. Quant aux personnes déplacées, la délégation a indiqué que des dispositions étaient prises 
pour favoriser le retour de beaucoup d’entre eux, grâce à la FAO et au HCR.   
 

II.  CONCLUSIONS AND/OR RECOMMENDATIONS 

74. The recommendations formulated during the interactive dialogue have been examined by 
Central African Republic and the recommendations listed below enjoy the support of the Central 
African Republic: 

1. Consider ratifying the Convention on the Political Rights of Women (Argentina; 
Djibouti); 

 
2. Consider ratifying (Turkey) / Ratify (Mexico) the Optional Protocol to the 

Convention on the Elimination of All Forms of Discrimination against Women 
(CEDAW); 

 
3. Consider ratifying of the Convention on the Prevention and Punishment of the 

Crime of Genocide (Democratic Republic of the Congo); 
 
4. Ratify (Mexico, Austria) / Consider ratifying (Djibouti) / Sign and ratify 

(Belgium) the Optional Protocol to the Convention on the Rights of the Child 
(CRC) on the involvement of children in armed conflict; and implement it 
nationally (Belgium); 

 
5. Consider ratifying (Turkey) / Timely ratify (Japan) the Optional Protocols to the 

CRC;  
 
6. Sign (Gabon) / Consider signing (Portugal) the Optional Protocol to the 

International Covenant on Economic, Social and Cultural Rights; at the opening 
for signature ceremony in New York in 2009 (Portugal); 

 
7. Continue efforts undertaken with a view to incorporating provisions of 

international instruments into domestic legislation and becoming a party to 
international instruments to which it is not yet a party (Chad); 

 
8. Continue to implement its poverty reduction strategy paper as a framework for 

dialogue and reference for all questions regarding national development policies 
(Tunisia);  

 
9. Continue to address reinstating of the rule of law through a fair and transparent 

electoral process and governance reform, reducing poverty which has caused 
worsening security, establishing basic infrastructure and creating jobs, with the 
support of the United Nations and the international community (Japan);  

 
10. With the support of the international community, further strengthen the national 

security forces and law enforcement agencies through various capacity-building 
measures (Bangladesh);  

 
11. Continue its extensive reforms with a view to addressing institutional 

shortcomings and weaknesses, and develop an integrated agenda of human rights 
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and public security as well as the development agenda towards poverty and 
illiteracy eradication (Nigeria); 

 
12. Consider implementing, with the assistance of OHCHR, a training and awareness-

raising programme on international human rights and humanitarian law for 
members of the security forces, law enforcement officials and judicial officials 
(Algeria); 

 
13. In the context of reforming the security sector, review training materials used by 

security forces in order to include child protection as a preventive measure against 
recruiting children in the armed forces (Canada); 

 
14. Implement a thorough training and awareness programme in international 

humanitarian and human rights law for members of the security forces (United 
Kingdom);  

 
15. Establish a permanent coordination structure for different security forces to 

consistently address various issues such as the training of the military and the 
provision of weapons to them; and ensure that members of the security forces 
receive training in humanitarian and human rights law and that they follow a 
programme for gender awareness at all ranks (Belgium); 

 
16. Ensure comprehensive training and education for all security forces and prison 

staff in human rights and international humanitarian law, and adopt legal and 
other necessary measures to ensure their full accountability for any violations of 
these norms (Czech Republic); 

 
17. Continue efforts to promote all universally agreed human rights and fundamental 

freedoms (Egypt); 
 
18. Continue resisting attempts to enforce any values or standards beyond the 

universally agreed ones (Egypt); 
 
19. Take all possible measures to ensure respect and promotion of international 

human rights law, international humanitarian law and international refugee law 
(Argentina); 

 
20. Further strengthen its cooperation with the international community, including 

OHCHR and treaty bodies (Republic of Korea); 
 
21. Implement the recommendations made by the Human Rights Committee 

following its consideration of the country’s periodic report (Ghana); 
 
22. Progressively accomplish human rights goals as set forth in Human Rights 

Council resolution 9/12, in particular increased cooperation with all mechanisms 
of the United Nations human rights system, including special procedures and 
treaty bodies (Brazil); 
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23. Further work to improve women’s political participation, educational 
opportunities and status in marriage and to reduce the maternal mortality rate 
(Japan); 

 
24. Continue exercising its sovereign right of implementing its penal code in 

conformity with universally agreed human rights standards, including the 
application of the death penalty (Egypt); 

 
25. Continue to firmly fight arbitrary executions and impunity, assure the protection 

of the civilian population and promote the return of refugees and displaced 
persons to their regions of origin (Azerbaijan); 

 
26. Enhance awareness-raising campaigns to combat and eradicate female genital 

mutilation and other traditional practices harmful to young women (Italy);   
 
27. Continue efforts to combat violence against women and to eradicate negative 

traditions (Azerbaijan); 
 
28. Launch wide education campaigns against the phenomenon of violence against 

perceived witches together with concrete measures to protect victims or potential 
victims of such attacks (Czech Republic); 

 
29. Demonstrate firm commitment to preventing the unlawful recruitment of child 

soldiers by directing the Ministry of the Interior to systematically monitor self-
defence militias (United States of America);  

 
30. Take all necessary measures to combat the recruitment and use of children in 

hostilities, including by releasing children associated with the conflict (Mexico); 
 
31. Take appropriate action to adopt and amend domestic legislation, including the 

Penal Code, and effectively implement this legislation to protect children from all 
forms of violence (Slovenia); 

 
32. Continue applying strategies to reduce criminality, address sexual abuse and child 

trafficking, and protect civilians from criminals (Angola); 
 
33. Continue efforts to put a halt to banditry and to help alleviate the suffering of its 

people by reforming its security services (Republic of the Congo); 
 
34. Strengthen efforts to guarantee minimum conditions for those held in police 

custody and detention centres in accordance with international standards, and 
follow up the specific recommendations of United Nations bodies in this regard 
(Netherlands);  

 
35. Continue strengthening its Court of Justice with a view to its carrying out its 

constitutional role without fear or favour (Nigeria);  
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36. Take all appropriate action to end the impunity of perpetrators of human rights 
crimes and cooperate with the International Criminal Court in this regard 
(Slovenia); 

 
37. Ensure that all reported human rights violations are investigated and that those 

responsible for such violations, including police officials and personnel within the 
security forces, are prosecuted and punished (Norway);   

 
38. Immediately investigate all cases of grave human rights violations and end 

impunity of perpetrators (Austria); 
 
39. Implement legal sanctions against those who commit human rights abuses in the 

security forces, in addition to administrative sanctions such as dismissal (United 
Kingdom); 

 
40. Focus its attention more on the serious issues of combating impunity; investigate 

human rights violations systematically and prosecute and punish those responsible 
for such violations, without exception (Republic of Korea);  

 
41. Ensure that members of the security forces suspected of violations of human 

rights or humanitarian law be rapidly handed over to justice for investigation and 
judgment; severe vetting action linked to recruiting and promotion is encouraged 
(Belgium); 

 
42. Continue national efforts in the area of disarmament, demobilization and 

reintegration and in the reform of institutions involved in security and promotion 
of the rule of law (Mexico); 

 
43. Intensify measures to promote the rule of law while consolidating peace and 

stability through dialogue and national reconciliation mechanisms (Viet Nam); 
 
44. Give human rights defenders legitimacy and recognition through supportive 

statements and ensure that they are protected in accordance with the United 
Nations Declaration on the Right and Responsibility of Individuals, Groups and 
Organs of Society to Promote and Protect Universally Recognized Human Rights 
and Fundamental Freedoms (Norway); 

 
45. Adopt further measures to ensure in practice the protection of journalists against 

threats and attacks, including imprisonment in contravention of their right to 
freedom of expression (Czech Republic);  

 
46. Take tangible and concrete steps to conduct free and fair Presidential elections 

without undue delay (United Kingdom);  
 
47. Continue its policy of national reconciliation and implement the decisions of the 

inclusive political dialogue (Democratic Republic of Congo); 
 
48. Continue to put in place effective strategies to reduce poverty, particularly in rural 

areas (Azerbaijan); 
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49. Take further measures to combat maternal mortality and, among others, give 
specific follow-up to the recommendation of the Committee on the Rights of the 
Child concerning availability of free medical assistance to pregnant women 
(Netherlands); 

 
50. With the assistance of the international community, undertake a multi-pronged 

approach to improve the situation of children with greater focus on ensuring 
universal primary education, reducing infant and child mortality and rehabilitating 
child combatants (Bangladesh); 

 
51. Guarantee the right to education of all children and take effective measures to 

substantially increase the rate of attendance in primary schools (Italy); 
 
52. Given the low level of children’s education and the illiteracy rates, implement 

measures necessary to change the landscape in this area and promote the 
reintegration of child soldiers in society (Azerbaijan); 

 
53. Accord the greatest priority to measures aimed at better ensuring the economic 

and social rights of its population, particularly by devoting more resources to 
programmes to combat poverty and illiteracy (Viet Nam);  

 
54. Take as soon as possible the necessary measures to safeguard the rights of 

internally displaced persons and refugees, ensure the protection of the civilian 
population in accordance with international standards and give follow-up to the 
specific recommendations in this regard of the Human Rights Committee and the 
Representative of the Secretary-General on human rights of internally displaced 
persons (Netherlands); 

 
55. Implement the Guiding Principles on Internal Displacement; enact a national law 

on internal displacement with provisions for protecting displaced children; 
effectively address the basic needs of persons affected by internal displacement; 
and take every measure to ensure the protection of civilians (Austria);   

 
56. Take measures as necessary to ensure free circulation of humanitarian workers so 

that they may access refugees and displaced persons (Canada); 
 
57. As recommended by CRC, solicit and receive technical and financial assistance 

from the international community, particularly from United Nations bodies and 
programmes, to give tangible form to various sections of the poverty reduction 
strategy paper, especially restoration of security, consolidation of peace and 
prevention of conflict, promotion of good governance, reconstruction of the 
economy and diversification and development of human capital (Algeria); 

 
58. Continue its efforts to ensure human rights, despite the variety of real constraints 

facing it, with the support of OHCHR and the whole international community 
(Burkina Faso); 

 
59. Seek from the international community, and especially from United Nations 

programmes and agencies, support for strengthening or, if not already available, 
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for creating capacity-building and technical assistance programmes, especially in 
the areas of human rights education, child labour, security, assistance to families 
and communities in fighting the effects of poverty and HIV/AIDS, education and 
juvenile justice (Cote d’Ivoire); 

 
60. Seek technical and financial support from the international community to achieve 

the MDGs and overcome its economic difficulties exacerbated by the current 
financial crisis (Djibouti); 

 
61. Seek technical and financial support from the international community so that 

efforts undertaken for good governance are not compromised (Republic of the 
Congo); 

 
62. Ask for further support from the international community to improve its human 

rights situation through technical assistance as appropriate (Chad); 
 
63. Ask the international community for assistance to strengthen its capacity, thereby 

supporting it in its actions, particularly to attain the MDGs (Morocco); 
 
64. Seek technical assistance in various areas from the international community, 

particularly OHCHR (Gabon); 
 
75. The following recommendations will be examined by the Central African Republic, 
which will provide responses in due time. The responses to these recommendations will be 
included in the outcome report adopted by the Human Rights Council at its twelfth session: 
 

1. Consider acceding to (Brazil) / Accede to (Azerbaijan ) / Consider ratifying 
(Turkey) / Ratify (Mexico) the Convention Against Torture and Other Cruel, 
Inhuman or Degrading Treatment or Punishment (CAT); 

 
2. Sign (United Kingdom) / Sign and ratify (France) the CAT and its Optional 

Protocol (OP-CAT); in order to provide a further disincentive against torture by 
the security forces and police (United Kingdom); 

 
3. Rapidly accede to (France) / Consider ratifying (Argentina) the International 

Convention for the Protection of All Persons from Enforced Disappearance; and 
accept the competence of the Committee on Enforced Disappearances 
(Argentina); 

 
4. Ratify (Portugal) / Consider ratifying (Argentina) / Accede to (Azerbaijan) the 

Second Optional Protocol to the International Covenant on Civil and Political 
Rights Aimed at the Abolition of the Death Penalty (ICCPR-OP 2); 

 
5. Consider ratifying the Protocol to the African Charter on Human and Peoples’ 

Rights on the establishment of an African Court on Human and Peoples’ Rights; 
the OAU Convention Governing the Specific Aspects of Refugee Problems in 
Africa; the Convention relating to the Status of Stateless Persons; the Convention 
on the Nationality of Married Women; international conventions on apartheid; 
and OP-CAT (Argentina); 
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6. Give tangible form to its wish to refurbish the National Human Rights 
Commission (Democratic Republic of the Congo); 

 
7. Establish a national commission for human rights, with sufficient guarantees of 

independence and adequate material and human resources, which would work in 
close cooperation with the United Nations (Spain); 

 
8. Speed up its efforts to ensure the proper functioning of the National Human 

Rights Commission in accordance with the Paris Principles (Ghana); 
 
9. Adapt internal legislation to international standards regarding national human 

rights institutions, including the Paris Principles (Argentina); 
 
10. Avail itself of technical assistance offered by OHCHR to submit its overdue 

reports (Algeria);  
 
11. Respond to the Human Rights Committee’s request to submit information within 

one year on the follow-up given to its recommendations in 2005 on female genital 
mutilation (Portugal); 

 
12. Make every effort to submit the reports to the treaty bodies in a timely fashion; 

and increase its level of response to the questionnaires sent by special procedures 
(Turkey);  

 
13. Extend an open and ongoing invitation to all human rights mechanisms to visit the 

country (Mexico);  
 
14. Consider extending (Latvia)/ Issue (Norway) a standing invitation to all special 

procedures of the Human Rights Council; 
 
15. Cooperate actively with the special procedures of the United Nations 

(Azerbaijan); 
 
16. Review all national legislation relating to the principle of non-discrimination, 

particularly as it applies to women and minorities, including sexual minorities, so 
that it complies fully with international instruments that prohibit all forms of 
discrimination (Czech Republic); 

 
17. Modify legislative provisions that may discriminate against women and in 

particular speed up the process of bringing the Family Code in line with 
international instruments (Italy); 

 
18. Bring the Family Code in line with international instruments (Portugal); 
 
19. Rapidly review the Family Code to abrogate all discriminatory provisions against 

women (France); 
 
20. Make efforts to abolish the death penalty and to ratify ICCPR-OP 2 (Brazil); 
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21. Seize the opportunity raised by the ongoing review of the Penal Code to consider 
abolishing capital punishment and acceding to ICCPR-OP 2 (Italy); 

 
22. Use the revision of the Criminal Procedure and Criminal Codes to tackle the 

question of the death penalty (Portugal); 
 
23. Remove any reference to the death penalty from the penal code (France); 
 
24. Abolish definitively the death penalty (Portugal, Germany, Spain);  
 
25. Prevent extrajudicial killings by members of the military, including the 

Presidential guard, and bring to justice those members of the military responsible 
for extrajudicial killings (United States); 

 
26. Put an end to cases of torture and ill-treatment in prisons and police stations 

(France); 
 
27. Abolish polygamy and adopt a plan to fight the scourge of  female genital 

mutilation, criminalizing this practice and mobilizing public opinion against it, 
and adopt measures to reduce violence against women, both rape and domestic 
violence (Spain); 

 
28. Prohibit female genital mutilation and take further steps to prevent and address 

the occurrence of female genital mutilation (Sweden); 
 
29. Take necessary measures to implement CEDAW, especially with emphasis on 

issues of violence and abuse based on gender (Canada); 
 
30. Remove any reference to the crime of witchcraft from the penal code (France); 

Amend the Penal Code to decriminalize witchcraft (United Kingdom); Delete the 
crime of witchcraft from the penal code (Czech Republic); 

 
31. Speed up measures to ensure reintegration into the community of minors giving 

up their weapons, making it possible to comply with the agreements undertaken 
by the Government and the Union of Democratic Forces for Unity with the United 
Nations; and conclude and implement these agreements in the case of other 
remaining irregular forces (Spain); 

 
32. Take concrete measures to abolish self-defence militias, to maintain order through 

regular security forces and to facilitate the end of forced child recruitment by all 
armed groups (Austria); 

 
33. Increase efforts to investigate and prosecute the individuals known to be 

responsible for the serious human rights violations that took place in the north of 
the Central African Republic between 2005 and mid-2007; ensure that victims are 
guaranteed remedy, including the right to compensation and reparation; and 
continue efforts to improve the protection of the civilian population (Sweden); 
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34. Adopt within its domestic legislation a law based on the Statute of the 
International Criminal Court criminalizing war crimes, the crime of genocide and 
crimes against humanity in the Criminal and the Military Justice Codes (Canada); 

 
35. Take the necessary steps to ensure that journalists are able to operate without 

intimidation or interference (Norway). 
 
76. All conclusions and/or recommendations contained in the present report reflect the 
position of the submitting State(s) and /or the State under review thereon. They should not be 
construed as endorsed by the Working Group as a whole. 

 
III. VOLUNTARY COMMITMENTS OF THE STATE UNDER REVIEW 

77. Lors de la présentation de son rapport, la République Centrafricaine a pris les 
engagements volontaires suivants : 

a) La réhabilitation d’ici 2010 au plus tard de la Commission Nationale des Droits 
de l’Homme ; 

b) La ratification de la Convention n°169 (1989) de l’OIT relative aux peuples 
indigènes et tribaux  du 27 juin 1989 d’ici le dernier trimestre 2009 ; 

c) L’élaboration et l’adoption du Plan d’Action National de promotion et de 
protection des droits de l’homme d’ici 2010 ; 

d) L’adoption des nouveaux Codes : le code pénal, le code de procédure pénale et de 
Justice militaire dont les projets des lois sont actuellement sur le bureau de l’Assemblée 
Nationale (dernier trimestre 2009) ; 

e) La lutte contre l’impunité des violations des droits de l’homme et autres crimes 
économiques ainsi que des infractions assimilées. 
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